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Series of 2024

SUBJECT: OMNIBUS GUIDELINES ON THE REGULATION OF SOCIAL 
WELFARE AND DEVELOPMENT AGENCIES (SWDAs) AND THEIR SOCIAL 
WELFARE AND DEVELOPMENT (SWD) PROGRAMS AND SERVICES

I. RATIONALE

Given the directive of the Marcos administration to digitalize government 
transactions and the directive of the Anti-Red Tape Authority (ARTA) to streamline 
work processes, the Department of Social Welfare and Development (DSWD) 
reviewed the guidelines related to its regulatory services and conducted various 
workshops to re-engineer its internai and external processes.

After several meetings with stakeholders and experts, the DSWD through the 
Standards Bureau (SB) developed these guidelines with the intention of streamlining, 
centralizing and digitalizing the processes related to the regulation of SWDAs and 
their programs and services.

Under these guidelines, all applications for registration and licensing of SWDAs and 
accreditation of their SWD programs and services will be processed in the DSWD 
Central Office through an online platform called the DSWD Harmonized Electronic 
License and Permit System (HELPS). This is one of the many new features 
developed by the DSWD and its streamlining team.

Although certain steps have been removed from the original process, thereby 
making the application process easier for the SWDA applicant, the DSWD now has 
stricter monitoring and enforcement mechanisms in place to ensure that SWDAs 
continually deliver quality social protection and poverty reduction measures to those 
in need, especially the poor, vulnerable and disadvantaged sectors of the 
community.

Further, the DSWD recognizes that the delivery of quality services by the SWDAs is 
contingent on their personnel that deliver the services to the disadvantaged. 
Considering the difficulty of hiring qualified social workers in the country, the DSWD 
would like to assist these agencies in upgrading their services by setting qualification 
standards for SWDA personnel and worker-beneficiary ratios. This will ensure that 
there are enough qualified social workers that would address the needs of the 
beneficiaries being supported by licensed SWDAs.

These guidelines serve as a comprehensive guide for the proper operation of a 
SWDA. It covers the following topics: registration and licensing of a SWDA;
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